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On the surface, Brandon Willard seems like your average eight-year-old boy. He loves his mama, peanut
butter and jelly sandwiches, and G. I. Joe. But Brandon's life is anything but typical.

Wise beyond his years, Brandon understands he's the only one in this world he can count on. It's an outlook
that serves him well the day his mama leaves him behind at the Raleigh bus station and sets off to Canada
with "her destiny" -- the latest man that she hopes will bring her happiness. The day his mother leaves,
Brandon takes the first step toward shaping his own destiny. Soon he sends himself spending pleasant days
playing with his cousins on his grandparents' farm and trying to forget the past. In the safety of that place,
Brandon finally is able to trust the love of an adult to help iron out the wiry places until his nerves are as
steady as any other boy's.

But when Sophie Willard shows up a year later with a determined look in her eye and a new man in tow,
Brandon's grandparents ignore a judge's ruling and flee the state with Brandon. Creating a new life and
identity in a small Florida town, Brandon meets the people who will fill him with self-worth and self-respect.
He slowly becomes involved with "God's Hospital," a church run by the gregarious Sister Delores, a woman
who is committed to a life of service for all members of the community, black and white, regardless of some
townsfolk's disapproval.
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From reader reviews:

Jacob Roberts:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, brief story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not hoping Slow Way Home that give your
pleasure preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be
said as the way for people to know world better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be
stated constantly that reading routine only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to end up
being success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading through as your good habit, you can pick
Slow Way Home become your own personal starter.

Louis Hartford:

This Slow Way Home is great guide for you because the content which is full of information for you who
always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. That book reveal it information
accurately using great arrange word or we can say no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read that
hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but
hard core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Slow Way Home in your hand like finding
the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no reserve that offer you
world within ten or fifteen second right but this reserve already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hey
Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt which?

Ronald Malone:

You may get this Slow Way Home by check out the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it may
to be your solve problem if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only
by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era including
now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own
personal ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately
make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.

Eric Rodriguez:

As a university student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library in
order to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's spirit or
real their pastime. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to presently there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and can't see colorful
pictures on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that
on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this Slow Way Home can make you sense more interested to read.
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