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New and Selected Poems includes more than fifty poems from Marjory Wentworth’s previous three
collections, Noticing Eden, Despite Gravity, and The Endless Repetition of an Ordinary Miracle, plus
twenty-eight new poems. This collection serves as a capstone to Wentworth’s tenure as South Carolina poet
laureate, a title she has held since 2003.

Thematically Wentworth’s poems invite us to view nature as a site of reflection and healing, to consider the
power of familial bonds and friendships, and to broaden our awareness of human rights and social justice.
Regional settings appear throughout, indicative of Wentworth’s commitment to represent her adopted home
state of South Carolina in her work. She skillfully employs a variety of forms, from prose poems to sonnets
to elegies to list poems, making for a varied and interesting trek through this “best of” collection of her
poems to date.

This collection includes a foreword by the poet Carol Ann Davis, author of Psalm and Atlas Hour and
assistant professor of English at Fairfield University.
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From reader reviews:

Kim Armstrong:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
That's why, you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their
particular spare time to take a walk, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book
eligible New and Selected Poems (Palmetto Poetry Series)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You
understand beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you
agree with their opinion or you have other opinion?

Randy Scott:

This New and Selected Poems (Palmetto Poetry Series) book is simply not ordinary book, you have it then
the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book will be information inside this e-
book incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get.
This kind of New and Selected Poems (Palmetto Poetry Series) without we know teach the one who
examining it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't end up being worry New and Selected Poems
(Palmetto Poetry Series) can bring if you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' turn into full
because you can have it within your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This New and Selected Poems
(Palmetto Poetry Series) having good arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not really feel
uninterested in reading.

Lillian Robbins:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information these days can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
any time those information which is within the former life are challenging be find than now's taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you receive
the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All
of those possibilities will not happen with you if you take New and Selected Poems (Palmetto Poetry Series)
as your daily resource information.

Robert Murphy:

The e-book untitled New and Selected Poems (Palmetto Poetry Series) is the reserve that recommended to
you to learn. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to an individual. The language
that article author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of
investigation when write the book, so the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also
might get the e-book of New and Selected Poems (Palmetto Poetry Series) from the publisher to make you
far more enjoy free time.
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