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O livro Soledad no Recife percorre as veredas dos testemunhos e das confissões ao reviver a passagem da
militante paraguaia Soledad Barret pelo Recife, em 1973, e a traição que culminou em sua tortura e
assassinato pela ditadura militar.

Delatada pelo próprio companheiro Daniel, conhecido depois como Cabo Anselmo, Soledad morre com um
grupo de candidatos a guerrilheiros, na capital pernambucana, pelas mãos da equipe do delegado Sérgio
Paranhos Fleury. O episódio ficou conhecido como "O massacre da chácara São Bento" e revelou-se mais
um extermínio do que um confronto armado.

A trama real inspira o romance em que Urariano Mota - com a propriedade de que viveu e sobreviveu aos
anos pós 1964 - resgata os vestígios da traição arquitetada contra Soledad e contra o País naqueles tempos,
com o olhar reflexivo de quem se volta ao passado. A vida e morte de Soledad é um forte contraponto a
"história oficial" propagada pela mídia na época e um testemunho da violência do Estado.

Nas palavras de Flávio Aguiar, que assina a apresentação da obra, Soledad no Recife é a recuperação de uma
história, "como preito àquelas vidas que se doaram e foram ceifadas pela traição inesgotável que foram o
golpe e à ditadura de 1964 ao seu próprio país - traição espelhada na de Anselmo ao amor que, sabe-se lá por
que, despertou em Soledad".
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From reader reviews:

Maxine Elam:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you need something
to explain what yours problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you don't
have spare time to try and do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have
extra time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They should answer that question
mainly because just their can do in which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it
is appropriate. Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this particular Soledad no Recife
(Portuguese Edition) to read.

Mark Jones:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With studying you can get a lot
of information which will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world may share their
idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire all their reader with their story
or maybe their experience. Not only situation that share in the publications. But also they write about the
ability about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children,
there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their
proficiency in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write on their book. One of them is this
Soledad no Recife (Portuguese Edition).

Loren Benton:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually you
will have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try matter that really opposite from that.
Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you already
been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Soledad no Recife (Portuguese Edition), you are able to
enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh
seriously its mind hangout men. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Gwendolyn Harrison:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to opt for book
like comic, brief story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not attempting Soledad no Recife
(Portuguese Edition) that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book.
Reading routine all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world far better then
how they react toward the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky
man but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for every you who want to start studying as
your good habit, you could pick Soledad no Recife (Portuguese Edition) become your current starter.
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