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This book examines the interrelationship of representational methods and material systems as fundamental
drivers of the design process. Identifying four primary categories of representational logics - point, line,
surface, mass - each category is illustrated through four precedent projects that deploy iterative material
sensibilities. As a collection, this text provides a comprehensive categorization of the architectural design
process.

Through the comprehensive definition of categorical typologies, it illustrates the collective capability of this
conceptual methodology. By unpacking projects through their specific design devices, the collective analysis
reveals the impact of material techniques and methods of representation as a generative tool. Broad in scope,
it identifies and uniformly analyses some of the most significant projects from the last century, including:

UK Pavilion Shanghai - Heatherwick Studio, Shanghai,China●

Gatehouse - Office dA, Beijing, China●

Maison Colonial - Jean Prouve, France/Africa●

de Young Museum - Herzog and de Meuron, California USA●

Montreal Expo 67 - Buckminster Fuller, Montreal, Canada●

Jean Marie Tjibou Cultural Center – RPBW, Noumea, Indonesia●

House III - Peter Eisenman, New York, USA●

Barcelona Pavilion - Mies van der Rohe, Barcelona, Spain●

Tel Aviv - Scott Cohen, Tel Aviv, Israel●

Los Manantiales - Felix Candella, Mexico City, Mexico●

Yokahama Terminal – FOA, Yokahama, Japan●

Pantheon, Rome, Italy●

Tres Grand Bibliotheque - Rem Koolhaas, OMA, Paris, France●

Brother Claus Field Chapel - Peter Zumthor, Switzerland●

Embryonic House- Greg Lynn●

Richly illustrated with consistent, clear and precise line drawings, the book presents a series of iconic
precedents through a unique analytical and graphic sensibility.
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From reader reviews:

Blanche Watson:

The book Process: Material and Representation in Architecture gives you the sense of being enjoy for your
spare time. You can use to make your capable more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you
getting anxiety or having big problem with your subject. If you can make looking at a book Process: Material
and Representation in Architecture to become your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like
add your capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You are able to know everything if
you like open up and read a book Process: Material and Representation in Architecture. Kinds of book are a
lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this
reserve?

Richard Sims:

This Process: Material and Representation in Architecture book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it
then the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is definitely information inside
this publication incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of
information you will get. This specific Process: Material and Representation in Architecture without we
realize teach the one who examining it become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't be worry Process:
Material and Representation in Architecture can bring once you are and not make your case space or
bookshelves' become full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even telephone. This Process:
Material and Representation in Architecture having good arrangement in word and layout, so you will not
experience uninterested in reading.

Janette Collins:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book mainly book entitled
Process: Material and Representation in Architecture your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in each aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging
each and every word written in a reserve then become one application form conclusion and explanation this
maybe you never get prior to. The Process: Material and Representation in Architecture giving you yet
another experience more than blown away your mind but also giving you useful details for your better life in
this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind are going to be pleased
when you are finished examining it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending
spare time activity?

Brandy Brobst:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book technique, more simple and reachable. This particular Process: Material and Representation in
Architecture can give you a lot of close friends because by you looking at this one book you have matter that



they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step
for you to get success. This book offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't understand, by
knowing more than different make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We should have Process:
Material and Representation in Architecture.
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