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Real-world case studies clarify valuation principles to help readers maximize returns

When founders, VCs, angels, attorneys, CFOs, CEOs, and employees don't understand the true meanings of
"value" and "valuation," they end up losing money—lots of money. Venture Capital Valuation is for anyone
involved in a venture capital- or angel-backed private company who wants to get the most out of their
investments by controlling one of the few things they can when dealing with high-velocity, risky
investments: their understanding of valuation.

Lorenzo Carver, author and developer of the #1 selling, award-winning small-business valuation solution
software, shares his decades of experience simplifying the high-growth company valuation process for
clients in every business sector. Anchored by scores of high-profile examples, Venture Capital Valuation
deftly illustrates how stakeholders in a given startup or high-growth company could have improved their
outcomes by having better information about valuation.

Helping readers answer such vital valuation questions as "What's this company worth?" "Is this a fair
valuation?" and "Are we leaving too much money on the table?" Venture Capital Valuation dissects the
valuation profiles of some of today's leading corporations, including:

Facebook●

Twitter●

LinkedIn●

Microsoft●

Yahoo!●

Kayak.com●

Zogenix●

Plus, interviews with venture-backed company valuation experts Jeff Faust, Josh Cashman, and Joe●

Orlando

A companion website allows readers to access and download additional material mentioned throughout the
text.

Don't wait until it's too late. Learn how "value" changes rights to cash flow at every stage of a company's
evolution with Venture Capital Valuation.
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From reader reviews:

Martha Skaggs:

The book Venture Capital Valuation: Case Studies and Methodology (Wiley Finance) gives you the sense of
being enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable more increase. Book can to become
your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make
reading a book Venture Capital Valuation: Case Studies and Methodology (Wiley Finance) to get your habit,
you can get much more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about several or
all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like available and read a book Venture Capital
Valuation: Case Studies and Methodology (Wiley Finance). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science
publication or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this reserve?

John Beaulieu:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can satisfy your
small amount of time to read it because this time you only find guide that need more time to be study.
Venture Capital Valuation: Case Studies and Methodology (Wiley Finance) can be your answer given it can
be read by an individual who have those short extra time problems.

Edgar Workman:

The book untitled Venture Capital Valuation: Case Studies and Methodology (Wiley Finance) contain a lot
of information on that. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy method. The language is very easy
to understand all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read it. The book was compiled by
famous author. The author gives you in the new era of literary works. You can actually read this book
because you can read on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book with anywhere and
anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can available their official web-site along with
order it. Have a nice study.

Hilary Winters:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by internet on social media. You can
choose the top book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is identified as
of book Venture Capital Valuation: Case Studies and Methodology (Wiley Finance). You'll be able to your
knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you actually
happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one spot to other
place.
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