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Over the past fifteen years, visitors from the African diaspora have flocked to Cape Coast and Elmina, two
towns in Ghana whose chief tourist attractions are the castles and dungeons where slaves were imprisoned
before embarking for the New World. This desire to commemorate the Middle Passage contrasts sharply
with the silence that normally cloaks the subject within Ghana. Why do Ghanaians suppress the history of
enslavement? And why is this history expressed so differently on the other side of the Atlantic?

Routes of Remembrance tackles these questions by analyzing the slave trade’s absence from public versions
of coastal Ghanaian family and community histories, its troubled presentation in the country’s classrooms
and nationalist narratives, and its elaboration by the transnational tourism industry. Bayo Holsey discovers
that in the past, African involvement in the slave trade was used by Europeans to denigrate local residents,
and this stigma continues to shape the way Ghanaians imagine their historical past. Today, however, due to
international attention and the curiosity of young Ghanaians, the slave trade has at last entered the public
sphere, transforming it from a stigmatizing history to one that holds the potential to contest global
inequalities.

Holsey’s study will be crucial to anyone involved in the global debate over how the slave trade endures in
history and in memory.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Gaitan:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your short lived
problem; you can add your knowledge by the publication entitled Routes of Remembrance: Refashioning the
Slave Trade in Ghana. Try to face the book Routes of Remembrance: Refashioning the Slave Trade in Ghana
as your pal. It means that it can for being your friend when you feel alone and beside that of course make you
smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you far more
confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let me make new experience and also
knowledge with this book.

William Threatt:

Typically the book Routes of Remembrance: Refashioning the Slave Trade in Ghana will bring you to the
new experience of reading a new book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In the event you
try to find new book to see, this book very suited to you. The book Routes of Remembrance: Refashioning
the Slave Trade in Ghana is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book from your
official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Bruce Bracey:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book particularly book entitled
Routes of Remembrance: Refashioning the Slave Trade in Ghana your thoughts will drift away trough every
dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely might be your mind friends.
Imaging every word written in a guide then become one web form conclusion and explanation in which
maybe you never get prior to. The Routes of Remembrance: Refashioning the Slave Trade in Ghana giving
you yet another experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful facts for your
better life in this particular era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern the following is your body and
mind will be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this
extraordinary investing spare time activity?

James Smith:

This Routes of Remembrance: Refashioning the Slave Trade in Ghana is great reserve for you because the
content that is full of information for you who always deal with world and also have to make decision every
minute. That book reveal it data accurately using great organize word or we can point out no rambling
sentences inside it. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only will
give you straight forward sentences but hard core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having
Routes of Remembrance: Refashioning the Slave Trade in Ghana in your hand like obtaining the world in
your arm, info in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no publication that offer you world with ten or



fifteen minute right but this book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs.
active do you still doubt that?
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