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Drawing on original empirical data with men who buy sex, this book takes a fresh look at the relationships
clients have with female sex workers. The core questions that form the backbone of the research are not only
the expected inquiry into 'why men buy sex', but also into the sociological and psychological processes that
men encounter in order to enter an assumed 'deviant' sexual behaviour as part of their everyday lives.

These sociological processes of finding, negotiating and buying sexual services are complicated by the
stigma directed towards men who buy sex. Exactly how do men behave with sex workers; what are their
relationships like; what emotions are involved and can intimacy be bought?

Questioning the dichotomy made between commercial and non-commercial relationships, the data suggests
that intimacy and commerce are compatible. Managing secrecy, stigma and the consumption of intimacy
takes this book into some of the more challenging theoretical areas of masculinity and emotional
consumption in contemporary society.

Drawing some parallels from the author's earlier book Sex Work: A Risky Business, the book offers insights
into why engagement in commercial sex is prolific as sexual culture is transformed in late modernity.
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From reader reviews:

David Williams:

The book Paying for Pleasure: Men Who Buy Sex can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. Why then must we leave the good thing like a book Paying for Pleasure: Men Who
Buy Sex? Several of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that book can give many info for
us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for
that, you could give for each other; you could share all of these. Book Paying for Pleasure: Men Who Buy
Sex has simple shape however you know: it has great and large function for you. You can search the
enormous world by open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Rachel Louviere:

The experience that you get from Paying for Pleasure: Men Who Buy Sex will be the more deep you
searching the information that hide within the words the more you get interested in reading it. It doesn't mean
that this book is hard to comprehend but Paying for Pleasure: Men Who Buy Sex giving you excitement
feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in selected way that can be understood through anyone
who read it because the author of this book is well-known enough. This book also makes your own personal
vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We propose you for having this specific Paying for Pleasure: Men Who Buy Sex instantly.

Willie Alford:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information currently can get by anyone on everywhere.
The information can be a information or any news even a problem. What people must be consider when
those information which is inside former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously which one is
acceptable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource then you
obtain it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen with you if you take Paying for Pleasure: Men Who Buy Sex as the daily resource information.

John Stevenson:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not attempting Paying for Pleasure: Men Who
Buy Sex that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading habit all over
the world can be said as the means for people to know world a great deal better then how they react in the
direction of the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading routine only for the geeky person but for all
of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all you who want to start looking at as your good
habit, you could pick Paying for Pleasure: Men Who Buy Sex become your own starter.
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