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A truthful, personal and insightful exploration of the state of arts funding and carrying on in the face of
adversity, by the renowned founder of Out of Joint.

One March morning, out of the blue, Max Stafford-Clark learned that the Arts Council had drastically cut
their grant to his theatre company, Out of Joint, leaving it in danger of imminent collapse. Journal of the
Plague Year is his account of what happened next, as he sets out to contest the cut, make the case for public
funding of the arts, and continue producing the work for which he and his company are renowned.

Max's journal often takes on an autobiographical flavour, including the unexpectedly moving story of his two
fathers, his surreal encounter with the New York theatre world, and the shocking details of what it is to suffer
a massively debilitating stroke.

By turns funny, alarming and deeply personal, Journal of the Plague Year offers a fascinating exposé of the
often Kafkaesque workings of arts subsidy in England, and the financial and artistic manoeuvrings which are
a fact of life for every arts organisation today. It is essential reading for anyone with an interest in the state of
our arts, from students to theatregoers, and from struggling arts workers right up to the Secretary of State for
Culture.

'Fascinating... reads like an unpublished work by Franz Kafka... both horrifying and startling' British Theatre
Guide
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From reader reviews:

Bernard Woodley:

The book Journal of the Plague Year gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can use to
make your capable more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting tension or having big
problem using your subject. If you can make reading through a book Journal of the Plague Year for being
your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about a
few or all subjects. You can know everything if you like open up and read a guide Journal of the Plague
Year. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do
you think about this e-book?

Kent Dennis:

The book Journal of the Plague Year can give more knowledge and also the precise product information
about everything you want. So why must we leave the good thing like a book Journal of the Plague Year?
Several of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim which book can give many facts for us. It is
absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that,
it is possible to give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Journal of the Plague Year has simple
shape however you know: it has great and large function for you. You can appearance the enormous world
by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

William Moreau:

With this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you
must do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of several
books in the top list in your reading list is definitely Journal of the Plague Year. This book and that is
qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upwards and
review this publication you can get many advantages.

Otis Key:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is published or printed or highlighted from each source which filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for anyone.
From media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, book
and comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just seeking the Journal of the Plague Year when you essential it?
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