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Exploring the increasing impact of the Internet on Muslims around the world, this book sheds new light on
the nature of contemporary Islamic discourse, identity, and community.

The Internet has profoundly shaped how both Muslims and non-Muslims perceive Islam and how Islamic
societies and networks are evolving and shifting in the twenty-first century, says Gary Bunt. While Islamic
society has deep historical patterns of global exchange, the Internet has transformed how many Muslims
practice the duties and rituals of Islam. A place of religious instruction may exist solely in the virtual world,
for example, or a community may gather only online. Drawing on more than a decade of online research,
Bunt shows how social-networking sites, blogs, and other "cyber-Islamic environments" have exposed
Muslims to new influences outside the traditional spheres of Islamic knowledge and authority. Furthermore,
the Internet has dramatically influenced forms of Islamic activism and radicalization, including jihad-
oriented campaigns by networks such as al-Qaeda.

By surveying the broad spectrum of approaches used to present dimensions of Islamic social, spiritual, and
political life on the Internet, iMuslims encourages diverse understandings of online Islam and of Islam
generally.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Carlson:

The actual book iMuslims: Rewiring the House of Islam (Islamic Civilization and Muslim Networks) will
bring you to definitely the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to clarify the idea is very
unique. When you try to find new book to study, this book very acceptable to you. The book iMuslims:
Rewiring the House of Islam (Islamic Civilization and Muslim Networks) is much recommended to you you
just read. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Patrick Richards:

You may spend your free time to study this book this publication. This iMuslims: Rewiring the House of
Islam (Islamic Civilization and Muslim Networks) is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in the
beach, train as well as soon. If you did not get much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy
often the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone.
Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Donald Lombard:

Within this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more treasured than
other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you have to do is just
spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of many books in the
top checklist in your reading list is actually iMuslims: Rewiring the House of Islam (Islamic Civilization and
Muslim Networks). This book which is qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in turning into
precious person. By looking upwards and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Ronald Sadowski:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is published or printed or outlined from each source which filled update of news.
In this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social just like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
looking for the iMuslims: Rewiring the House of Islam (Islamic Civilization and Muslim Networks) when
you essential it?
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