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In 1998, Estonia became the first of the former Soviet republics to enter membership negotiations with the
European Union. Since then it has been hailed as 'the model pupil' amongst the current applicants. This study
traces the remarkable reforms that have propelled Estonia from the USSR to the threshold of the EU in less
than a decade. The work also explores the tensions inherent in the concept of a postcommunist 'return to
Europe'. Since 1991, membership of western transnational organizations has been consistently portrayed as
the best guarantee of Estonia's independence. Yet the membership criteria imposed by these organizations
have frequently confllicted with the nationalist priority of restoring a sovereign Estonian nation-state. At the
same time, Estonia's geopolitically-sensitive location poses a dilemma for the West, thereby ensuring that the
country will remain the 'litmus test' - not just of Russia's intentions towards Europe, but of the 'New Europe'
as a whole.
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From reader reviews:

Fred Green:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to learn everything in the world. Each book has different aim or goal; it means that book has different
type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They may be reading whatever they
take because their hobby will be reading a book. What about the person who don't like examining a book?
Sometime, man feel need book when they found difficult problem or maybe exercise. Well, probably you
should have this Estonia: Independence and European Integration (Postcommunist States and Nations).

Judith Smith:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? That's
why, you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to
take a walk, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book called Estonia:
Independence and European Integration (Postcommunist States and Nations)? Maybe it is to become best
activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can cleverer than
before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have other opinion?

Raymond Floyd:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you really
need something to explain what yours problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man or
woman? If you don't have spare time to do others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have
spare time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They should answer that question due to
the fact just their can do this. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is suitable.
Because start from on guardería until university need this particular Estonia: Independence and European
Integration (Postcommunist States and Nations) to read.

Hector Duggan:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the headline Estonia:
Independence and European Integration (Postcommunist States and Nations) suitable to you? Often the book
was written by famous writer in this era. Typically the book untitled Estonia: Independence and European
Integration (Postcommunist States and Nations)is the main one of several books which everyone read now.
This specific book was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this e-book you will
enter the new shape that you ever know prior to. The author explained their idea in the simple way, so all of
people can easily to be aware of the core of this e-book. This book will give you a large amount of
information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world on this book.
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